
 

Embark on an unparalleled vinous journey with "Viña el Moral," 
an extraordinary red wine hailing from the prestigious Rioja 
region in Spain. This exceptional creation, a true masterpiece, is 
the result of the meticulous craftsmanship of the visionary wi-
nemaker, Adrián Moreno Llorente, of the esteemed Rulei wine-
ry. Elevating the exclusivity of this wine is its limited production, 
with only 1400 bottles to grace the discerning palates of for-
tunate enthusiasts. 

Nestled in the heart of Rioja, the Viña el Moral vineyard stands 
majestically at an elevation of 623 meters above the sea, impar-
ting a unique terroir to the Garnacha grape variety. The wine's 
appearance is nothing short of mesmerizing—a clear deep purple 
hue that captivates the eye and hints at the splendor within.  

As the first olfactory encounter unfolds, a vibrant and clean aro-
ma fills the senses with a medium intensity, revealing primary 
notes of blossoms, roses, strawberries, red cherries, blackcur-
rants, and succulent blackberries. Layers of jammy fruits, black-
currant leaf, medicinal nuances, lavender, white pepper, and a 
subtle trace of liquorice contribute to the symphony, while the 
delicate scent of wet stones evokes the very essence of the vine-
yard. 

Secondary aromas of vanilla, coconut, butterscotch, and cedar 
interweave with finesse, adding a layer of sophistication to the 
bouquet.  

Tertiary elements of dried blackberry, cooked blackberry, lea-
ther, and hints of the forest floor unveil the wine's evolving and 
nuanced character—an eloquent expression of its limited produc-
tion and uniqueness. 

On the palate, Viña el Moral unfolds its vibrant personality—a 

dry composition marked by a refreshing surge of high acidity. 
Medium-low tannins gracefully provide structure, while the high 
level of alcohol and full-bodied richness create an opulent tape-
stry for the senses.  

Primary flavors burst forth in a harmonious medley, echoing the 
aromatic symphony with blossoms, roses, strawberries, red 
cherries, blackberries, and luscious black cherries. Kirsch, jam-
miness, blackcurrant leaf, medicinal nuances, lavender, white 
pepper, and a lingering touch of liquorice create a captivating 
palate.  

Secondary notes of vanilla, butterscotch, and cedar contribute to 
the wine's vibrancy, while tertiary elements of dried blackberry, 
cooked blackberry, leather, and the whisper of the forest floor 
add layers of depth and intrigue. 

As the journey reaches its zenith, Viña el Moral graces the palate 
with a long, lingering finish—a testament to its outstanding qua-
lity and the enduring legacy it represents.  

This exclusive wine, with its limited production and vibrant cha-
racter, stands as a living testament to Adrián Moreno Llorente's 
unparalleled artistry and the distinctive terroir of Viña el Moral. 
Each sip is an invitation to indulge in the rarity and vibrancy en-
capsulated in every precious drop, celebrating the legacy of Rioja 
winemaking with this unparalleled gem 

 Disclaimer: The sensory analysis of this wine has been done with 
the SAT principles developed by WSET and made by Johan Teide 
(WSET lvl. 3.), the notes feature in 
bold and italics, the prose has been 
made by an AI poet 

Viñ a El Moral Siñgle Viñyard 

Reading instruction: The following should be read out loud with a sense of pathos and a certain level of pomposity! 

http://www.thecowine.com/

